Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

1 2 3

Bull Rock, Clean ASP Qilfield Colorado Materials Neumann Welding

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 600 Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| * Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| * Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| *

Delivery Delivery Delivery
Rank Rank Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 17.00 11.00 28.00 2 15.00 20.00 35.00 16.25 10.00 26.25 1

Any County Road 17.00 11.00 28.00 2 15.00 22.00 37.00 16.25 10.00 26.25 1
Precinct #2

Stockpile 17.00 11.00 28.00 2 15.00 21.50 36.50 16.25 11.10 27.35 1

Any County Road 17.00 11.00 28.00 2 15.00 23.50 38.50 16.25 11.10 27.35 1
Precinct #3

Stockpile 17.00 11.00 28.00 2 15.00 21.00 36.00 16.25 10.00 26.25 1

Any County Road 17.00 11.00 28.00 2 15.00 23.00 38.00 16.25 10.00 26.25 1
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 17.00{  12.00]  29.00 | 15.00] 23.00] 38.00] 16.25 12.20] 2845 2
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 17.000 12.00 29.00f 2 | 1500 25.00]  40.00| 16.25 12.20] 2845 1
Precinct #4

Any County Road 17.00 12,000 29.000 2 | 1500 27.00] 42.00] 16.25] 1220 2845 1

Transfer Station
Stockpile 17.000 11.00] 28.00] 2 | 1500 21.00] 36.00| 16.25] 1220 2845 1
Pickup
Pick-Up 17.00'********' 15.00'********' |********|
Pick-Up Location Thomaston Hunter Tx

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

4 5

(CONTINUED) Prihoda Vulcan

Bull Rock, Clean

Unit: Tons ] Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material +

Total Quantity: 600 ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 16.00 12.00 28.00 3 42.50 63.58 106.08 0.00

Any County Road 16.00 14.00 30.00 3 42.50 63.58 106.08 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 16.00 12.00 28.00 42.50 61.46 103.96 0.00

Any County Road 16.00 13.00 29.00 42.50 61.46 103.96 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 16.00 12.00 28.00 3 42.50 64.27 106.77 0.00

Any County Road 16.00 14.00 30.00 42.50 64.27 106.77 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 16.00 12.00 28.00] 1 | 4250 6427 106.77| | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 16.00] 14.00]  30.00| | 4250 64.93] 107.43 | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 16.00]  14.00]  30.00| | 4250 64.93] 107.43 | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 16.00 13.00]  29.00| | 4250 6281 10531 | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 16.00|********| 42_50|********| |********|
Pick-Up Location Altair Freeport

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas 3
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

1 2 3

Bull Rock, with Clay ASP Oilfield Neumann Welding Plilhieitte

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 600 Material | Delivery I\/lljaetltievr;arl; Material | Delivery I\/lljaetlfvr;arl; Material | Delivery I\/lljaetltievr;arl;

Rank Rank Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 17.00[ 11.00]  28.00 1500 10.00] 2500 1 1400 12.00] 26.00[ 2

Any County Road 17.00{ 11.00] 28.00[ 2 1500 10.00] 25.00[ 1 14.00  14.00]  28.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 17.00[  11.00]  28.00 1500 1110 26.10[ 2 1400 12.00] 26.00[ 1

Any County Road 17.00/ 11.00]  28.00 15000 1110 26.10[ 1 1400 13.00 27.00 2
Precinct #3

Stockpile 17.00[ 11.00]  28.00 1500 10.00] 25.00[ 1 1400 12.00] 26.00[ 2

Any County Road 17.00{ 11.00] 28.00[ 2 1500 10.00] 25.00[ 1 14.00  14.00]  28.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | 1700 12.00[ 29.00| | 1500 1220 27200 2 | 1400 1200 2600 1
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | 1700 12.00[ 29.00| | 1500 12200 27200 1 | 1400 1400 2800 2
Precinct #4

Any County Road | 1700 12.00[ 29.00] | 1500 1220 27200 1 | 1400 1400 2800 2

Transfer Station
Stockpile | 1700 1100[ 28.00 | 1500 12200 27200 2 | 1400 1300 2700 1
Pickup
Pick-Up 17_00|********| |********| 14_00|********|
Pick-Up Location Thomaston Altair

Bid Results FY 2022 1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

1

Gravel, Pea 3/8" Neumann Welding

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 600 Material Delivery Mat?”al * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat?”al *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 18.00 20.00 38.00 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 18.00 20.00 38.00 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 18.00 21.10 39.10 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 18.00 21.10 39.10 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 18.00 20.00 38.00 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 18.00 20.00 38.00 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 18.00 2220/ 4020 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 18.00 2220/ 4020 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 18.00 2220/ 4020 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 18.00 2220/ 4020 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

oravel.pea 5/ NO BID NO BID NO BID

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 550 Material Delivery Mat?”al * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat?”al *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

1 2 3

Gravel, Pit Run ASP Qilfield Neumann Welding Prihoda

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 21,200 Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 6.00/ 11.00[ 17.00 9.00/ 10.00[  19.00 5.25 9.25|  14.50 1

Any County Road 6.00 11.00( 17.00[ 2 9.00( 10.00[  19.00 525/ 11.25[ 16.50 1
Precinct #2

Stockpile 6.00/ 11.00[ 17.00 9.00{ 11.10[ 20.10 5.25 7.00  12.25 1

Any County Road 6.00 11.00{ 17.00 9.00/ 11.10[ 20.10 5.25 9.00] 14.25 1
Precinct #3

Stockpile 6.00 11.00( 17.00[ 2 9.00/ 10.00[  19.00 5.25/ 10.00[  15.25 1

Any County Road 6.00[ 11.00[ 17.00 1 9.00{ 10.00[  19.00 525/ 1175 17.00[ 2
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 6.00[ 12.00]  18.00 | 9.0 1220 21.20] 525/ 950 1475 1
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 600 12.00 1800 2 | 9.0 12.20] 21.20 525/ 11.00] 1625 1
Precinct #4

Any County Road 6.000 1200 1800 2 | 9.0 1220 21.20] 525] 11.25] 1650 1

Transfer Station
Stockpile 6.00 11.00] 17.00] |  9.00[ 1220 21.20 525  9.00] 1425 1
Pickup
Pick-Up 6.00|********| |********| 4_50|********| 2-ALL
Pick-Up Location Thomaston Altair

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

4

Gemuel, it R Zaist

:-j:tl; L:nasntit :21.200 Material | Delivery Material + Material | Delivery Material + Material | Delivery Material +

y: el Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 4.50 12.40 16.90 2 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 15.00 19.50 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 4.50 8.00 12.50 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 10.50 15.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 4.50 13.30 17.80 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 4.50 15.50 20.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 4.50 12.40 16.90 2 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 4.50 14.60 19.10 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4

Any County Road 4.50 15.00 19.50 0.00 0.00

Transfer Station
Stockpile 4.50 12.40 16.90 2 0.00 0.00
Pickup
Pick-Up 4.50 | *HxHkrnx 1-ALL ko ok ok K Kok kK
Pick-Up Location Altair

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

1 2

Gravel, Post Oak Pit Run w/Red Clay ASP Oilfield Neumann Welding

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 11,500 Material Delivery Mat?”al * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat?”al *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 9.00 10.00 19.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 9.00 10.00 19.00 2 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 9.00 11.10 20.10 2 0.00

Any County Road 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 9.00 11.10 20.10 2 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 9.00 10.00 19.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 6.00 11.00 17.00 1 9.00 10.00 19.00 2 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 6.000 1200 1800] 1 | 900 1220 2120 2 | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 6.000 1200 1800] 1 | 900 1220 2120 2 | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 6.000 1200 1800] 1 | 900 1220 2120 2 | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 6.000 1100 17000 1 | 900 1220 2120 2 | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 6.00|********| 1-ALL |********| |********|
Pick-Up Location Thomaston

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

1 2 3

Gravel, Screened ASP Qilfield Neumann Welding Prihoda

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 16,500 Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 8.00] 11.00]  19.00 7.75] 1000 1775 2 6.25 9.75| 16.00] 1

Any County Road 8.00 11.00] 19.00 775 1000 1775 1 6.25| 11.75] 18.00 2
Precinct #2

Stockpile 8.00 11.00]  19.00 7.75| 1110 18.85 6.25 7.000 1325 1

Any County Road 8.00] 11.00]  19.00 7.75] 11.10] 18.85 6.25 9.00 1525/ 1
Precinct #3

Stockpile 8.00] 11.00]  19.00 7.75] 1000 1775 2 6.25] 1050 1675 1

Any County Road 8.00 11.00] 19.00 775 1000 1775 1 6.25| 12.25] 1850 2
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 8.00[ 12.00]  20.00| |  7.75] 12.20] 19.95] 6.25| 9.75] 16.00] 1
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 8.00[ 12.00]  20.00| | 775] 1220 1995 2 6.25| 1150 17.75] 1
Precinct #4

Any County Road 8.00] 12.00] 20.00] | 775 1220 1995 2 6.25] 11.75] 1800 1

Transfer Station
Stockpile 8.00[ 11.00]  19.00| | 7.75] 12.20] 19.95] 6.25| 9.75] 16.00] 1
Pickup
Pick-Up 8.00|********| 3-PCT 2 |********| 6.25|********| 1-ALL
Pick-Up Location Thomaston Altair

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

10

4

(CONTINUED) Zbranek

Gravel, Screened

Unit: Tons ] Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material +

Total Quantity: 16,500 ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 6.50 12.40 18.90 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 15.00 21.50 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 6.50 8.00 14.50 2 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 10.50 17.00 2 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 6.50 13.30 19.80 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 15.50 22.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 6.50] 12.40] 1890 2 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 6.50] 14.60] 21.10] | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 6.50] 15.00] 21.50] | | 0.00] | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 6.50] 12.40] 1890 2 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 6.50|********| 2-ALL |********| |********|
Pick-Up Location Altair

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

11

1 2 3

Gravel, Screened w/Red Clay ASP Qilfield Neumann Welding Prihoda

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 12,000 Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 8.00] 11.00]  19.00 10.00]  10.00]  20.00 6.25 9.75| 16.00] 1

Any County Road 8.00 11.00] 19.00 2 10.00[  10.00]  20.00 6.25 11.75] 18.00 1
Precinct #2

Stockpile 8.00 11.00]  19.00 10.00[ 1110 21.10 6.25 7.000 1325 1

Any County Road 8.00] 11.00]  19.00 10.00] 11.10] 21.10 6.25 9.00 1525/ 1
Precinct #3

Stockpile 8.00] 11.00] 19.00] 2 10.00]  10.00]  20.00 6.25] 1050 1675 1

Any County Road 8.00 11.00] 19.00 2 10.00[  10.00]  20.00 6.25| 12.25] 1850[ 1
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 8.00[ 12.00]  20.00| | 1000 12.20] 22.20] 6.25| 9.75] 16.00] 1
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 800 12.00 2000 2 | 1000 12.20] 22.20 6.25| 1150 17.75] 1
Precinct #4

Any County Road g.00] 12,00 2000 2 | 1000 1220 22.20] 6.25] 11.75] 1800 1

Transfer Station
Stockpile 8.00[ 11.00]  19.00| | 10.00] 12.20] 22.20] 6.25| 9.75] 16.00] 1
Pickup
Pick-Up 8.00|********| |********| 6.25|********| 1-ALL
Pick-Up Location Thomaston Altair

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

12

4

(CONTINUED) Zbranek

Gravel, Screened w/Red Clay

Unit: Tons ] Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material +

Total Quantity: 12,000 ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 6.50 12.40 18.90 2 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 15.00 21.50 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 6.50 8.00 14.50 2 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 10.50 17.00 2 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 6.50 13.30 19.80 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 6.50 15.50 22.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 6.50] 12.40] 1890 2 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 6.50] 14.60] 21.10] | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 6.50] 15.00] 21.50] | | 0.00] | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 6.50] 1240] 1890 2 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 6.50|********| 2-PCT2, PCT4 |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location

Altair

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

13

Lime, Hi-Cal Hydrated, Bagged NO BI D NO BI D NO BI D

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 400 Material Delivery Mat?”al * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat?”al *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

14

Lime, Hydrated, Not-Bagged NO BI D NO BI D NO BI D

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 925 Material Delivery Mat?”al * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat?”al *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

15

1 2 3

Limestone, 3/4" to Dust Colorado Materials Marek & Marek Trucking Matagorda Construction

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 2,450 Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 6.00 20.00 26.00 475 20.25 25.00 2 6.00 25.75 31.75

Any County Road 6.00 22.00 28.00 25.00(.25/mi 6.00 25.75 31.75
Precinct #2

Stockpile 6.00 21.50 27.50 4.75 20.75 25.50 2 6.00 25.75 31.75

Any County Road 6.00 23.50 29.50 25.50(.25/mi 6.00 25.75 31.75
Precinct #3

Stockpile 6.00 21.00 27.00 475 20.25 25.00 2 6.00 25.75 31.75

Any County Road 6.00 23.00 29.00 25.00(.25/mi 6.00 25.75 31.75
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 6.00[ 23.00]  29.00| |  475] 2225] 2700 2 6.00[ 2575 3175
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 6.00 25.00] 31.00] | 475 2425 2900 2 6.00 25.75] 31.75]
Precinct #4

Any County Road 6.00 27.00] 33.00] | 27.00[25/mi | | 6.00] 25.75] 31.75]

Transfer Station
Stockpile 6.00[ 21.00] 27.00| | 475] 2050 2525 2 6.00[ 2575 3175
Pickup
Pick-Up 6.00|********| 25.00'********' 1-ALL 32_25|********|
Pick-Up Location Hunter Tx Edna Stock Bay City

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

16

4 5 6

(FONTINUED) Neumann Welding Prihoda Quality Hot Mix

Limestone, 3/4" to Dust

:’j:tI:I (;Zra‘:tity' 2,450 Material | Delivery Matt'erial ¥ Material | Delivery Mat('erial ¥ Material | Delivery Matt'erial ¥

> Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 7.00 20.00 27.00 0.00 6.00 19.00 25.00 1

Any County Road 7.00 20.00 27.00 2 0.00 6.00 20.00 26.00 1
Precinct #2

Stockpile 7.00 21.10 28.10 0.00 6.00 19.00 25.00 1

Any County Road 7.00 21.10 28.10 2 0.00 6.00 20.00 26.00 1
Precinct #3

Stockpile 7.00 20.00 27.00 0.00 6.00 19.00 25.00 1

Any County Road 7.00 20.00 27.00 2 0.00 6.00 20.00 26.00 1
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 7.00] 2220 29.20] | | |  o.00| 6.000 19.00] 2500 1
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 7.00] 2220 29.20] | | |  o.00| 6.000 2000 2600 1
Precinct #4

Any County Road 7.00] 22200 2920 2 | | | o.00| 6.000 19.00] 2500 1

Transfer Station
Stockpile 7.00] 2220 29.20] | | |  o.00| 6.000 19.00] 2500 1
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| 26.75|********| 29.50|********|
Pick-Up Location Altair New Taiton or El Campo

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

17

1 2 3

Limestone, 1 1/2" to 1" Colorado Materials Marek & Marek Trucking Matagorda Construction

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 4,500 Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 5.00 20.00 25.00 2 475 20.25 25.00 5.00 25.75 30.75

Any County Road 5.00 22.00 27.00 2 25.00(.25/mi 5.00 25.75 30.75
Precinct #2

Stockpile 5.00 21.50 26.50 4.75 20.75 25.50 2 5.00 25.75 30.75

Any County Road 5.00 23.50 28.50 2 25.50(.25/mi 5.00 25.75 30.75
Precinct #3

Stockpile 5.00 21.00 26.00 475 20.25 25.00 2 5.00 25.75 30.75

Any County Road 5.00 23.00 28.00 25.00|.25/mi 2 5.00 25.75 30.75
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 500 23.00] 28.00] |  475] 2225] 2700 2 500 2575 30.75]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 5.00] 25.00] 30.00] | 475 2425 2900 2 5.00] 25.75]  30.75]
Precinct #4

Any County Road 5.00] 27.00] 32.00] | 27.00[25/mi | | s.00] 25.75] 3075] 2

Transfer Station
Stockpile 500 21.00] 26.00| | 475] 2050 2525 2 500 2575 30.75]
Pickup
Pick-Up 5_00|********| 25.00'********' 1-ALL 31_90|********|
Pick-Up Location Hunter Tx Edna Stock Bay City

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

18

4 5 6

(FONTINUED) Neumann Welding Prihoda Quality Hot Mix

Limestone, 11/2" to 1"

:-j:tl; L:nasntity. 4,500 Material | Delivery Matt'erial ¥ Material | Delivery Mat('erial ¥ Material | Delivery Matt'erial ¥

>0 Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 14.00 20.00 34.00 0.00 5.00 19.50 24.50 1

Any County Road 14.00 20.00 34.00 0.00 5.00 20.50 25.50 1
Precinct #2

Stockpile 14.00 21.10 35.10 0.00 5.00 19.50 24.50 1

Any County Road 14.00 21.10 35.10 0.00 5.00 20.00 25.00 1
Precinct #3

Stockpile 14.00 20.00 34.00 0.00 5.00 19.50 24.50 1

Any County Road 14.00 20.00 34.00 0.00 5.00 20.00 25.00 1
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 14.00] 2220 36.20| | | | o.00| 5,000 1950 2450 1
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 14.00] 2220 36.20| | | | o.00| 5,000 2200 2700 1
Precinct #4

Any County Road 14.00] 2220 36.20| | | | o.00| 5,000 1950 2450 1

Transfer Station
Stockpile 14.00] 2220 36.20| | | | o.00| 5,000 2000 2500 1
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| 24.75|********| 29.00|********|
Pick-Up Location Altair New Taiton or El Campo

Bid Results FY 2022
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7

((':ONTINUED) .

Limestone, 11/2" to 1"

Unit: Tons ] Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material +

Total Quantity: 4,500 ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 37.00 57.08 94.08 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 37.00 57.08 94.08 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 37.00 56.31 93.31 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 37.00 56.31 93.31 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 37.00 57.08 94.08 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 37.00 57.08 94.08 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 37.00] 5546 92.46] | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 37.00] 5546 92.46] | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 37.00] 5546 92.46] | | 0.00] | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 37.00 57.08] 94.08] | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 37.00|********| |********| |********|
Pick-Up Location Freeport

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

20

1 2

Limestone, Dust Colorado Materials Quality Hot Mix

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 650 Material Delivery Mat?”al * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat?”al *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 3.00 20.00 23.00 1 6.00 23.00 29.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 3.00 22.00 25.00 1 6.00 24.00 30.00 2 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 3.00 21.50 24.50 1 6.00 23.00 29.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 3.00 23.50 26.50 1 6.00 24.00 30.00 2 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 3.00 21.00 24.00 1 6.00 23.00 29.00 2 0.00

Any County Road 3.00 23.00 26.00 1 6.00 24.00 30.00 2 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 3000 2300 26000 1 | 600 2400 3000 2 | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 3000 2500 2800] 1 | 600 2500 3100 2 | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 3000 2700 3000 1 | 600 2500 3100 2 | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 3000 2100 2400] 1 | 600 2500 3100 2 | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 3_00|********| 30.00|********| |********|
Pick-Up Location Hunter Tx New Taiton or El Campo

Bid Results FY 2022
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1 2 3

Limestone, Grade 5 (Ice Rock) Colorado Materials Matagorda Construction Neumann Welding

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 450 Material | Delivery Mat('erlal * Material | Delivery Mat('erlal * Material | Delivery Mat('erlal *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 30.00 20.00 50.00 20.00 25.75 45.75 2 26.00 20.00 46.00

Any County Road 30.00 22.00 52.00 20.00 25.75 45.75 2 26.00 20.00 46.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 30.00 21.50 51.50 20.00 25.75 45.75 2 26.00 21.10 47.10

Any County Road 30.00 23.50 53.50 20.00 25.75 45.75 2 26.00 21.10 47.10
Precinct #3

Stockpile 30.00 21.00 51.00 20.00 25.75 45.75 2 26.00 20.00 46.00

Any County Road 30.00 23.00 53.00 20.00 25.75 45.75 2 26.00 20.00 46.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 30.00]  23.00]  53.00] | 2000 2575] 45.75] 2 26.00]  22.20]  48.20]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 30.00]  25.00]  55.00] | 2000 2575] 45.75] 2 26.00]  22.20]  48.20]
Precinct #4

Any County Road 30.00]  27.00]  57.00] | 2000 2575] 45.75] 2 26.00]  22.20]  48.20]

Transfer Station
Stockpile 30.00] 21.00]  51.00] | 2000 2575] 45.75] 2 26.00]  22.20]  48.20]
Pickup
Pick-Up 30.00|********| 48.00'********' 1- PCT4 |********|
Pick-Up Location Hunter Tx Bay City

Bid Results FY 2022
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4

CONTINUED . .

:.imestone, G)rade 5 (Ice Rock) OWEIg] R 2

:-j:tl; L:nasntity. 450 Material | Delivery Matt'erial ¥ Material | Delivery Mat('erial ¥ Material | Delivery Matt'erial ¥

: Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 15.00 19.00 34.00 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 15.00 20.00 35.00 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 15.00 19.00 34.00 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 15.00 20.00 35.00 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 15.00 19.00 34.00 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 15.00 20.00 35.00 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 15.000 19.00] 3400 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 15.00 2000 3500 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 15.00 2000 3500 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 15.00 2000 3500 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 31.00|********| |********| |********|
Pick-Up Location New Taiton

Bid Results FY 2022
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1 2 3

Limestone, Non-Coated, Grade 4 Colorado Materials Matagorda Construction Neumann Welding

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 10,200 Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat('erlal *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 35.00 20.00 55.00 17.36 25.75 43.11 2 26.00 20.00 46.00

Any County Road 35.00 22.00 57.00 17.36 25.75 43.11 2 26.00 20.00 46.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 35.00 21.50 56.50 17.36 25.75 43.11 2 26.00 21.10 47.10

Any County Road 35.00 23.50 58.50 17.36 25.75 43.11 2 26.00 21.10 47.10
Precinct #3

Stockpile 35.00 21.00 56.00 17.36 25.75 43.11 2 26.00 20.00 46.00

Any County Road 35.00 23.00 58.00 17.36 25.75 43.11 2 26.00 20.00 46.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 35.00] 23.00] 58.00] | 1736/ 2575] 43.11] 2 26.00]  22.20]  48.20]
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 35.00]  25.00]  60.00] | 1736/ 2575] 43.11] 2 26.00]  22.20]  48.20]
Precinct #4

Any County Road 35.00 27.00] 62.00] | 1736 2575 4311 1 26.00[ 2220  48.20|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 35.00] 21.00]  56.00] | 1736] 2575] 43.11] 26.00]  22.20]  48.20]
Pickup
Pick-Up 35.00|********| 53.00|********| |********|
Pick-Up Location Hunter Tx Bay City

Bid Results FY 2022
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4

((.:ONTINUED) Quality Hot Mix

Limestone, Non-Coated, Grade 4

:-j:tl; E,nasntity- 10,200 Material | Delivery Matt'erial ¥ Material | Delivery Mat('erial ¥ Material | Delivery Matt'erial ¥

i Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 19.00 20.00 39.00 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 19.00 21.00 40.00 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 19.00 20.00 39.00 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 19.00 21.00 40.00 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 19.00 20.00 39.00 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 19.00 21.00 40.00 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 19.00 2300 4200 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 19.00 2400 4300 1 | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 19.00 2500 4400 2 | | 0.00] | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 19.00 20.00]  39.00| | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 40_00|********| 1- PCT2 |********| |********|
Pick-Up Location New Taiton

Bid Results FY 2022
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1 2 3

Limestone, Pre-Coated Grade 4 Colorado Materials Neumann Welding Quality Hot Mix

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,900 Material Delivery Mat?”al * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat?”al *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 48.00]  20.00[  68.00 46.00]  20.00[  66.00] 2 50.00 9.00[ 59.00[ 1

Any County Road 48.00]  22.00[  70.00 46.00]  20.00[ 66.00] 2 50.00 10.00] 60.00] 1
Precinct #2

Stockpile 48.00]  21.50[  69.50 46.00]  21.10[ 67.10] 2 50.00)  10.00{  60.00| 1

Any County Road 48.00]  23.50[ 71.50 46.00] 21.10[ 67.10] 2 50.00 11.00] 61.00] 1
Precinct #3

Stockpile 48.00]  21.00[  69.00 46.00]  20.00[  66.00] 2 50.00 9.00/ 59.00[ 1

Any County Road 48.00]  23.00 71.00 46.00]  20.00[ 66.00] 2 50.00 10.00] 60.00] 1
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 48.00 23.00 71.00| | 4600 2220 6820 2 50.00[ 11.00 61.00 1
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 48.00 25.00[  73.00| | 4600 2220 6820 2 50.00[ 13.00 63.00] 1
Precinct #4

Any County Road 48.00 27.00[  75.00 | 4600 2220 6820 2 50.00 13.00 63.00] 1

Transfer Station
Stockpile 48.00 2100  69.00| | 4600 22.20[ 68.20 50.00 10.00]  60.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 48.00|********| |********| 50.00'********'
Pick-Up Location Hunter Tx New Taiton

Bid Results FY 2022
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(CONTINUED) 4

Limestone, Pre-Coated Grade 4 vl

Unit: Tons ] Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material + Material | Deli Material +

Total Quantity: 1,900 ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank ateria elivery Delivery Rank
Precinct #1

Stockpile 28.50 71.70 100.20 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 28.50 71.70 100.20 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 28.50 73.50 102.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 28.50 73.50 102.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 28.50 72.60 101.10 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 28.50 72.60 101.10 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 28.50]  74.94| 103.44] | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 28.50]  74.94| 103.44] | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 28.50]  74.94| 103.44] | | 0.00] | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 28.50[  73.50] 102.00| | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 28.50|********| |********| |********|
Pick-Up Location Dabney

Bid Results FY 2022
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1 2 3

Mix, Cold Colorado Materials Neumann Welding Waller Co Asphalt

Unit: Tons

Total Quantity: 1,900 Material Delivery Mat?”al * Material Delivery Mat('erlal * Material Delivery Mat?”al *

Delivery Rank Delivery Rank Delivery Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 69.00)  20.00[  89.00] 1 46.00|% 20.00[  66.00 91.00] 112.20[ 203.20

Any County Road 69.00] 22.00 91.00] 1 46.00 | 20.00[  66.00 91.00] 112.20[ 203.20
Precinct #2

Stockpile 69.00 2150 90.50| 1 46.00 | 21.10( 67.10 91.00] 110.20[ 201.20

Any County Road 69.00] 2350 9250 1 46.00[  21.10] 67.10 91.00] 110.20[ 201.20
Precinct #3

Stockpile 69.00) 21.00[ 90.00| 1 46.00(  20.00[  66.00 91.00] 113.20[ 204.20

Any County Road 69.00] 23.00 92.00] 1 46.00]  20.00] 66.00 91.00] 113.20[ 204.20
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 69.00 23.00] 92000 1 | 4600 2224 68.20] 91.00[ 116.30[ 207.30
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 69.00 2500 9400 1 | 4600 2220 68)20| 91.00[ 117.68] 208.68|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 69.00[ 27.00] 96.00] 1 | 4600 2220 68)20] 91.00[ 112.40[ 203.40|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 69.00 21.00]  90.00| | 4600 22.20[ 6820 91.00[ 114.69] 205.69)
Pickup
Pick-Up 69.00|********| |********| 91_00|********| 1-ALL
Pick-Up Location Hunter Tx

Bid Results FY 2022

*Vendor withdrew bid.*
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1 2 3
Mix, Hot Colorado Materials Neumann Welding Quality Hot Mix
Unit: Tons
Total Quantity: 950 Material | Delivery Mat<.eria|+ Material | Delivery Mat<.eria|+ Material | Delivery Mat<.eria|+
Delivery Delivery Delivery
Rank Rank Rank
Precinct #1
Stockpile 70.00] 1000 80.00] 2 71.00]  28.00]  99.00 68.00 8.00| 76.00] 1
Any County Road 70.00] 11.00[ 81.00] 2 71.00]  28.00]  99.00 68.00 9.00 77.00] 1
Precinct #2
Stockpile 70.00 1150[ 8150 2 71.00]  29.10] 100.10 68.00 8.00] 76.00[ 1
Any County Road 70.00] 1250 8250 2 71.00]  29.10] 100.10 68.00 9.000 7700 1
Precinct #3
Stockpile 70.00] 1000 80.00] 2 71.00]  28.00]  99.00 68.00 8.00| 76.00] 1
Any County Road 70.00] 12.00] 82.00] 2 71.00]  28.00]  99.00 68.00 9.00 77.00] 1
Precinct #4A
Stockpile 70.00 1250 8250 2 | 7100 3020 101.20] 68.00 10.00] 78.00] 1
Precinct #4B
Stockpile 70.00 1250 8250 2 | 7100 3020 101.20] 68.00 13.00 8100 1
Precinct #4
Any County Road 70.00 1500 8500 2 | 7100 3020 101.20] 68.00 13.00 8100 1
Transfer Station
Stockpile 70.00 1150 81.50| | 7100 3020 101.20 68.00  8.00[ 76.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 70_00|********| 2-ALL |********| 68.00'********| 1-ALL
Pick-Up Location Nursery Tx New Taiton

Bid Results FY 2022
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1

Pot Hole Emulsion PSquared Emulsion

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 18,000 Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| * Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| * Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| *

Delivery Delivery Delivery
Rank Rank Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 2.99 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 2.99 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 2.99 1 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 2.99 1 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 2.99| | 1| | 0.00] | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 2.99| | 1| | 0.00] | |  o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 2.99| | 1| | 0.00] | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 2.99| | | | 0.00] | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 2_74|********| |********| |********|

Pick-Up Location

Elm Mott Tx 76640

Bid Results FY 2022
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1 1

Stabilizer, Dust Control Charter Chemical PSquared Emulsion

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 8,000 Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| * Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| * Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| *

Delivery Delivery Delivery
Rank Rank Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 9.50 0.00 9.50 1 2.69 2.69 0.00

Any County Road 9.50 0.00 9.50 1 2.69 2.69 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 9.50 0.00 9.50 1 2.69 2.69 0.00

Any County Road 9.50 0.00 9.50 1 2.69 2.69 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 9.50 0.00 9.50 1 2.69 2.69 0.00

Any County Road 9.50 0.00 9.50 1 2.69 2.69 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile 950/ 000 950 1 | 2.9 | 2.69] | | o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile 950/ 000 950 1 | 2.9 | 2.69] | |  o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road 950/ 000 950 1 | 2.9 | 2.69] | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile 950 000  9.50] | 269 | 2.69] | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 9_50|********| 2_44'********| |********|

Pick-Up Location

8498 Doffling Rd Mission TX 78574

Elm Mott Tx 76640

Bid Results FY 2022
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Stabilizer, Portland Cement (3%) with NO BI D NO BI D NO BI D

Application

Unit: Tons . . Material + . . Material + . . Material +

Total Quantity: 750 Material | Delivery Delivery Material | Delivery Delivery Material | Delivery Delivery

Rank Rank Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile |  o.00| | | | o.00| |  o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | o.00| | | | o.00| | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | o.00| | | | o.00| | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile |  o.00| | | | o.00| |  o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up |********| |********| |********| |

Pick-Up Location

Bid Results FY 2022
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Stabilizer, Road with Application NO BID NO BID NO BID

Unit: Gallons

Total Quantity: 18,500 Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| * Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| * Material | Delivery Mat<.eria| *

Delivery Delivery Delivery
Rank Rank Rank

Precinct #1

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #2

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #3

Stockpile 0.00 0.00 0.00

Any County Road 0.00 0.00 0.00
Precinct #4A

Stockpile | | o.00| | | | o.00| | |  o.00|
Precinct #4B

Stockpile | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Precinct #4

Any County Road | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|

Transfer Station
Stockpile | | o.00| | | | o.00| | | o.00|
Pickup

Pick-Up Location

Bid Results FY 2022

1/5/2022



Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas 33
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials
1 2
Stabilizer, Road Product Only Charter Chemical PSquared Emulsion
Unit: Gallons
Total Quantity: 19,150 Material | Delivery Matt'erial * Material | Delivery Matt'erial * Material | Delivery Matt'erial *
Delivery Delivery Delivery
Rank Rank Rank
Precinct #1
Stockpile 16.00 0.00 16.00 1 2.69 0.00
Any County Road 16.00 0.00 16.00 1 2.69 0.00
Precinct #2
Stockpile 16.00 0.00 16.00 1 2.69 0.00
Any County Road 16.00 0.00 16.00 1 2.69 0.00
Precinct #3
Stockpile 16.00 0.00 16.00 1 2.69 0.00
Any County Road 16.00 0.00 16.00 1 2.69 0.00
Precinct #4A
Stockpile 16.00 0.00 16.00 1 2.69 0.00
Precinct #4B
Stockpile 16.000 000 16000 1 | 2.69 | | | | o.00|
Precinct #4
Any County Road 16.000 000 16000 1 |  2.69] | | | | o.00|
Transfer Station
Stockpile 16.00  0.00] 16.00] | 269 | | | | o.00|
Pickup
Pick-Up 16.00|********| 2.44|********| |********| |
Pick-Up Location 8498 N Doffling Rd Mission Tx 78574 Elm Mott Tx 76640
Bid Results FY 2022 1/5/2022



NOTES:

Official Bid Results for Jackson County, Texas 34
2022 Annual Supply Contract of Road Materials

Charter Chemical:

Discount available on bulk orders. $9.00/gallon on bulk transport loads. Application rate 0.2 gallons per square yard. Product
name Resinator. Spec sheet included.

Neumann Welding

Delivery time is within 24 hours from order date and time.

PSquared Emulsion:

Please see attached equivalent and/or superior product description and Sole Source Affidavit. PSquared is proudly recognized
and accepted by Tarrant County Co-Op.

Quality Hot Mix

All Deliveries are in end dump trailers. Belly dump trailers can be requested & provided if available.

Waller County Asphalt:

Cold mix - bid is for ASPPM9202 Grade IV, High Performance.

Bid Results FY 2022
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